



**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY**  
**PURCHASING DEPARTMENT**  
75 North Pace Boulevard  
Pensacola, FL 32505

**BID AWARD NOTICE**

**DATE:**  
**March 7, 2016**

**BID TITLE & REFERENCE:**  
**Food Processing: USDA Commodities, RFP #161202**

**DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:**

An annual agreement to provide food processing of USDA commodity items into ready to use products for use in the preparation of school lunches. Items are stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for cafeterias throughout the District. Bidders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for the commodity/lot were awarded in each area. No bids were received for nine (9) items and seven (7) items were not awarded for various reasons. Sixty-two (62) items were bid, forty-six (46) items are awarded.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017.

**REQUESTED BY:**

Food Services

**SUPPLIER NAME:**

**ITEMS AWARDED:**

**ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:**

Bongards, Chaska, MN	6	\$ 59,397.00
Chef's Corner, Hayward, CA	4	234,232.00
Jennie-O, Willmar, MN	8	240,872.00
JTM Processing, Harrison, OH	9	290,180.00
Land O' Lakes, St. Paul, MN	7	72,868.00
Pilgrim's Pride, Tucker, GA	2	411,300.00
Tyson Foods, Springdale, AR	10	717,360.00

**AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:**

\$2,026,209.00 Est. / Yr.

**FUNDING SOURCE:**

Food Services Fund (4110)

**METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:**

ECSD RFP

Responses Received: 20 Responses Rejected: 1

**DATE AND TIME POSTED:**

March 7, 2016, 2:30 pm Central Time

**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY  
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD  
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505  
BID TABULATION**

DATE: February 24, 2016

Awarded Items are highlighted

RFP NBR: 161202

BID TITLE: Food Processing: USDA Commodities

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviado, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Meat Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
1	<b>Sweet and Sour Chicken (0516820)</b>	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Green Dragon/Asian Food Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Chef's Corner Foods	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	72005	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CMDTYWG-0116	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	72005	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	COMWG-0116	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	3.90 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.92 OZ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	176 servings	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	171.429	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	6/5# ck; 6/2.15# sauce	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	42 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$82.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$78.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.5461	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5485	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	<b>Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (0516830)</b>	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Green Dragon/Asian Food Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Chef's Corner Foods	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	73001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CMDTY-0117B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	73001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	COM-0117B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	2.85 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.80 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	240	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	6/7.15 # ck & sauce	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	42 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$81.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$78.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.4149	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4239	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	<b>Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)</b>	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Green Dragon/Asian Food Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Chef's Corner Foods	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	72001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CMDTYWG-0111	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	72001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	COMWG-0111	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	3.90 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.92 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	176	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	171.429	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	6/5# ck; 6/2.15# sauce	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	42 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$81.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$77.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.5405	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5401	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid









Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
17	<b>Beef Taco Meat - Reduced Sodium (0516170)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQK12500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNK12500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.03 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	158	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4623	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	<b>Beef Meatballs (0516191)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	1-17-505-0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ28053VS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	3-17-505-0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN280053VS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	2.5 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.00 OZ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	192/2.5 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	23.02 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.4851	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	<b>Ground Beef Patties (0516115)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ162403	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN162403	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.40 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.7613	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid









Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
29	<b>Beef, Flame Broiled Patty (0516113)</b>		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	1-155-525-20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ212503	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	155-525-20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN212503	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	2.5 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.50 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	31.25 lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	31.25 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	19.42 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.4782	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5813	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30	<b>Country Fried Steak (0516150)</b>		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	69035	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ633803	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	68035	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN633503	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	3.8 oz.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.80 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	130	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	20.19 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.875 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	11.65 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$25.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.8203	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.7082	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
31	<b>Beef Steak, Cooked, Breaded (0516132) (DELETED)</b>	(a)(u)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	1-15-312-09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ621603	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	15-312-09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN621603	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	1.01 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.60 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	475	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	42.32 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$29.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.3790	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4316	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



















Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
<b>58</b>	<b>Potatoes, Roasted Chunks (0514430)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>59</b>	<b>Tater Tots (0514380)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>60</b>	<b>Potato Wedges (0514311)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>61</b>	<b>Pizza Bagels, Mini (DELETED)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>62</b>	<b>Chicken Chili Stick (0516660) (DELETED)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(a)(u)	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Fernando's	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5274	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5274	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.70 oz	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	54	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	54	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.16	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4289	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
1	<b>Sweet and Sour Chicken (0516820)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	Minh	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15551-7	No Bid	No Bid	69016 100113-Chicken Legs	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15551-7	No Bid	No Bid	69016	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	3.6 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	192 servings	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	43.5 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	42.00 Net lbs	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$94.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$140.61	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5680	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6560	No Bid	No Bid
2	<b>Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (0516830)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	(a)(u)
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	Minh	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15554-8	No Bid	No Bid	69018 10013-Chicken Legs	No Bid	026072-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15554-8	No Bid	No Bid	69018	No Bid	026072-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz	No Bid	3.31 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	240 serv.	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	180
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	42 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	42.00 Net lbs	No Bid	37.32#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$87.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$115.05	No Bid	\$76.13
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4403	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5500	No Bid	\$0.67
3	<b>Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	(a)(u)
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	Minh	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15555-5	No Bid	No Bid	69020 100113-Chicken Legs	No Bid	026073-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15555-5	No Bid	No Bid	69020	No Bid	026073-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	3.6 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz	No Bid	4 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	192 serv.	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	142
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	43.5 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	42.00 Net lbs	No Bid	35.80#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$88.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$140.61	No Bid	\$75.54
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5371	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6560	No Bid	\$0.82

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
4	<b>Kung Pao Chicken Without Vegetables (0516851)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15556-2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15556-2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	240 serv.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	42 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$87.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4403	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	<b>Chicken, 8 Piece Breaded (0516550)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	(a)(u)
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7812	No Bid	No Bid	666000-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	666000-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 Breast, 1 Thigh, 1 Drum and 1 Wing combo	No Bid	No Bid	4.7-8.4 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	About 80	No Bid	No Bid	57/100 Range(Target 82 svg)
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	35#	No Bid	No Bid	29.64#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$53.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$55.13
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.077	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.95
6	<b>Chicken, 8 Piece Roasted (0516540)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	(a)(u)
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8820	No Bid	No Bid	021879-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	021879-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 Breast, 1 Thigh, 1 Drum and 1 Wing combo	No Bid	No Bid	3.7-6.5 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	About 88	No Bid	No Bid	57/100 85 Target
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	23.08#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$45.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.93
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.985	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.72
7	<b>Chicken Patty, Small, Breaded (0516581)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	635300	No Bid	No Bid	005778-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	635300	No Bid	No Bid	005778-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.63 oz	No Bid	No Bid	1.6 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	294	No Bid	No Bid	200
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	20#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.00
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.198	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.20

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
8	<b>Chicken Patty, Home-Style, Breaded (0516901)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	665400	No Bid	No Bid	070304-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	665400	No Bid	No Bid	070304-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.05 oz	No Bid	No Bid	3.54 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	156	No Bid	No Bid	148
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	32.82#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$39.71
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.373	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.37
9	<b>Chicken Patty, Breaded, Hot and Spicy (0516910)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	666600	No Bid	No Bid	005567-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	666600	No Bid	No Bid	005567-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.05 oz	No Bid	No Bid	3.26 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	156	No Bid	No Bid	148
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	30.28#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$37.85
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.398	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.44
10	<b>Chicken Tender-Shaped Strips Breaded (0516860)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	625300	No Bid	No Bid	070334-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	625300	No Bid	No Bid	070334-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.06 oz	No Bid	No Bid	3.39 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	156	No Bid	No Bid	150
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	31.86#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.55
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.373	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.36

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
11	<b>Chicken Tenders, Whl Muscle, Breaded (0516650)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	070332-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	070332-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.23 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	117
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.99#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$61.98
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.82
12	<b>Popcorn Chicken, Breaded (0516871)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	691600	No Bid	No Bid	070368-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	691600	No Bid	No Bid	070368-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.08 oz	No Bid	No Bid	3.36 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	103	No Bid	No Bid	155
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	20#	No Bid	No Bid	32.79#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$28.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$39.68
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.395	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.36
13	<b>Popcorn Chicken, Spicy, Breaded (0516880)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	070378-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	070378-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.3 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	159
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	32.79#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$40.33
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.35
14	<b>Chicken Breast Filets, Whl Muscle, Breaded (0516930)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7516	No Bid	No Bid	070300-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7516	No Bid	No Bid	070300-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4 oz	No Bid	No Bid	App 4 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	120	No Bid	No Bid	104-136 (120 Avg)
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	30#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$67.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$70.50
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.77	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.84



Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR			
15	<b>Chicken Fajita Strips (0516890)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid				
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1325	No Bid	No Bid	003522-0928			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1325	No Bid	No Bid	003522-0928			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.451	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	195	No Bid	No Bid	Approx. 228			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	39.93#			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$73.87			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.439	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.70			
15	<b>Chicken Fajita Strips (0516890)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1330	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1330	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.46 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	195	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
16	<b>Grilled Chicken Patty (0516560)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid				
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7520	No Bid	No Bid	070322-0928			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7520	No Bid	No Bid	070322-0928			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3 oz	No Bid	No Bid	2.26 oz			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	106	No Bid	No Bid	215			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	20#	No Bid	No Bid	30.39#			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$75.98			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.54			
17	<b>Beef Taco Meat - Reduced Sodium (0516170)</b>	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	JTM	No Bid	No Bid	Maid-Rite	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	CP5250	No Bid	No Bid	100154	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	5250CE	No Bid	No Bid	75156-03200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	3.17 oz	No Bid	No Bid	2.35 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	151	No Bid	No Bid	204	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	30#	No Bid	No Bid	30 lbs 6/5lb bags	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	\$24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$37.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.4921	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5186	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
17	<b>Beef Taco Meat - Reduced Sodium (0516170)</b>	(a)(m)(y)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	JTM	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	CP5232	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	5232CE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	2.89 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	166	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	30 #	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	\$29.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.3354	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR			
18	<b>Beef Meatballs (0516191)</b>	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	JTM	No Bid	No Bid	Maid-Rite	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	CP5030	No Bid	No Bid	75156-94316	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	5030CE	No Bid	No Bid	75156-04316	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	2.80 oz - 5 mb	No Bid	No Bid	2.40 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	171	No Bid	No Bid	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	30 #	No Bid	No Bid	30 lbs 6/5# bags	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	\$23.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.5543	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5421	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
18	<b>Beef Meatballs (0516191)</b>	(a)(m)(y)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	JTM	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	CP5035	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	5035CE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	2.60oz = 4mb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	184	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	30#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	\$26.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.5201	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
19	<b>Ground Beef Patties (0516115)</b>	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	JTM	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	CP5670	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	5670CE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	2.45 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	195	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	30 #	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	\$22.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.6639	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
20	<b>Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
21	<b>Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			



Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
26	<b>Turkey Roast (0516311)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	<b>Turkey Pot Roast (DELETED)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	<b>Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	<b>Beef, Flame Broiled Patty (0516113)</b>	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	(a)(u)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	JTM	No Bid	No Bid	Maid-Rite	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	CP5661	No Bid	No Bid	75156-93427	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	5661CE	No Bid	No Bid	75156-03427	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	2.20 oz	No Bid	No Bid	2.25 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	228	No Bid	No Bid	213	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	31.43 #	No Bid	No Bid	30 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	\$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.4413	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6418	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



















Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR			
58	<b>Potatoes, Roasted Chunks (0514430)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
59	<b>Tater Tots (0514380)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
60	<b>Potato Wedges (0514311)</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			



<b>BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST</b>									
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <a href="http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids">http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids</a> .									
Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.									
I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.									
<i>John Dombroskie</i>									
John Dombroskie, Director									
Purchasing Director									